Information on the day rates (fee/price) of Mental Health and Learning Disability rehabilitation services

(Freedom of Information request)

FOI Questions
1. Do you purchase mental health rehabilitation services on a block contract or as a spot purchase? Please tick appropriate box.
[ Block contract (if yes, please see questions 2) YES
I Spot purchase (if yes please see question 3) YES

2. If services are bought on a block contract, please provide the number of bed days commissioned and £ spent on mental health
rehabilitation services for following years financial years (FY), defined as April- March.

Year Number of bed days sold Type of provider Type of Provider
Independent NHS
FY15-16 5786 2465 251
FY14-15 5227 3659 451
FY13-14 Information not available 4285 0

FY12-13 RCCG do not hold this
information as it applies to

the former PCT

If services are spot purchased on a sport contract, please provide the day rates, in £, of the latest 20 service users you have placed

in a mental health rehabilitation service; further please state if the provider in which the service was place an independent (private

or charity) or NHS provider.

Suesrglrze Year of placement Day rate (£) Type of provider (independent or NHS)
1 2014 316.20 Independent
2 2013 316.20 Independent




3 2013 290.70 Independent
4 2013 290.70 Independent
5 2012 285.00 Independent
6 2012 290.70 Independent
7 2012 285.00 Independent
8 2010 234.10 Independent
9 2010 330.00 Independent
10 2014 325.00 NHS
11 2013 325.00 Independent
12 2015 325.00 Independent
13 2015 325.00 Inependent
14 2015 325.00 NHS
15 2015 371.80 Independent
16 2012 285.00 Independent
17 2013 290.70 Independent
18 2013 316.20 Independent
19 2013 315.00 Independent
20 - - -

b. If any of the service users from 3.a have received any further payments (in the forms of top-ups/ additional observations/
specialing) please indicate the latest available weekly cost; please use the service user number from 3.a as a reference/index.
Indicate if when a service user did not get further payments with “n.a”.

Service

uSers Weekly cost (£)

1 | Has received short-term 1:1
for 3 days. Unable to
quantify as a weekly cost

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A
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11 N/A

12 N/A

13 N/A

14 N/A

15 | Has received some
additional 1:1. All short-
term and often only for 1 or
2 days. As such, cost
variable. Unable to
quantify as a weekly cost.

16 N/A

17 N/A

18 N/A

19 N/A

20 -

4. Do you purchase Learning Disability rehabilitation services on a block contract or as a spot purchase? Please tick appropriate box.

[ Block contract (if yes, please see questions 5) Yes
[ Spot purchase (if yes please see question 6) Yes

5. If services are bought on a block contract, please provide the number of bed days commissioned and £ spent on Learning Disability
rehabilitation services for following years financial years (FY), defined as April- March.

Year Number of bed days sold Type of provider Type of provider
independent NHS

FY15-16 0 830 121

FY14-15 0 719 9

FY13-14 365 730 365

FY12-13 RCCG do not hold this - -

information as it applies to
the former PCT




a. If services are spot purchased on a sport contract, please provide the day rates, in £, of the latest 20 service users you have placed
in a Learning Disability rehabilitation service; further please state if the provider in which the service was place an independent
(private or charity) or NHS provider.

Service

USers Year of placement Day rate (£) Type of provider (independent or NHS)
1 2010 351.90 Independent
2 2013 597.86 Independent
3 2015 357.14 Independent
4 2015 1208.85 Independent
5 2016 2232.00 NHS
6 2010 396.00 NHS
7
8
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10
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b. If any of the service users from 3.a have received any further payments (in the forms of top-ups/ additional observations/
specialing) please indicate the latest available weekly cost; please use the service user number from 3.a as a reference/index.
Indicate if when a service user did not get further payments with “n.a”.

Service Weekly cost (£)
users
1 N/A
2 N/A
3 N/A
4 | Additional 1:1 is
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End of FOI

incorporated into total cost
indicated above

Additional 1:1 is
incorporated into total cost

N/A




